Ordinance 2007-11
Page 1 of 16

ORDINANCE NO. 2007-11

AN ORDINANCE TO REPEAL CHAPTER 2 OF TITLE VI, OF THE
1999 MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE CITY OF URBANDALE, IOWA,
AND TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE A COMPLETE BUILDING CODE
REGULATING THE ERECTION, CONSTRUCTION, ENLARGEMENT,
ALTERATION, REPAIR, MOVING, REMOVAL, CONVERSION,
DEMOLITION, OCCUPANCY, EQUIPMENT, USE, HEIGHT, AREA,
AND MAINTENANCE OF BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES; TO
PROVIDE FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTIONS
OF FEES; AND TO PROVIDE PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS.

Be it ordained by the Council of the City of Urbandale, lowa:
SECTION 1.0000: Chapter 2 of Title VI of the 1999 Municipal Code of the City of

Urbandale, lowa, is hereby repealed and a new Chapter 2 established by inserting the
following in lieu thereof:

SECTION 2.0000: Short Title. This Ordinance shall be known as the City of Urbandale,
lowa Building Code, and may be cited as such and will be referred to herein as "This
Ordinance" or "This Code".

SECTION 3.0000: Adoption of Building Code. Pursuant to published notice and public
hearing as required by law, the International Building Code and the International
Residential Code, 2006 Edition, published by the International Code Council and
commonly known as the International Building Code (IBC) and International Residential
Code (IRC), are hereby adopted in full except for such portions as may be hereinafter
deleted, modified or amended.

An official copy of the International Building Code and International Residential Code,
2006 Edition, as adopted and a certified copy of this Ordinance are on file in the office
of the Building Official. A copy of the International Building Code and the International
Residential Code, 2006 Edition, and copy of this Ordinance have been furnished to the
Municipal Library. A copy of this ordinance has been furnished to the newspaper.

SECTION 4.0000: Amendments, Modifications, Additions and Deletions.
Amendments to the International Building Code are identified by ‘IBC’ and amendments
to the International Residential Code are identified by ‘IRC’.

The following amendments, modifications, additions and deletions to the IBC and IRC,
2006 Edition, are hereby made:



Ordinance 2007-11
Page 2 of 16

4.0101: Revise IBC Section 101.1 and IRC Section R101.1 by inserting ‘City of
Urbandale’ in the brackets.

4.0102: In IBC Section 105.2 and IRC section R105.2 amend item number 1 to read:
“One story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses,
and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet and the
structure does not utilize a permanent foundation.”

Also, delete item numbered 2. "Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high."

4.0103: Add new section 105.8 to the IBC and new Section R105.9 to the IRC as
follows: “No building permits shall be issued to any person or company who has fees
outstanding, or who has outstanding, unresolved violations of this code or any other
laws or ordinances of the City. The Building Official may waive this restriction for just
cause.”

4.0104: Permit fees mentioned in IRC section R108.2 shall be as described by this
ordinance. Add IBC subsection 108.2.1 entitled:

“Building Permit Fees

TOTAL VALUATION FEE
$1 to $500 $12.76
$501 to $2,000 $12.76 for first $500 plus $1.97 for

each additional $100 or fraction
thereof, to and including $2,000

$2,001 to $25,000 $42.31 for the first $2,000 plus
$8.93 for each additional $1,000 or

fraction thereof, to and including
$25,000

$25,001 to $50,000 $247.70 for the first $25,000 plus
$5.95 for each additional $1,000 or

fraction thereof, to and including
$50,000

$50,001 to $100,000 $396.45 for the first $50,000 plus




Ordinance 2007-11
Page 3 of 16

$4.14 for each additional $1,000 or
fraction thereof, to and including
$100,000

$100,001 to $500,000

$603.45 for the first $100,000 plus
$3.82 for each additional $1,000 or
fraction thereof, to and including
$500,000

$500,001 to $1,000,000

$2,131.45 for the first $500,000
plus $3.51 for each additional
$1,000 or fraction thereof, to and
including $1,000,000

$1,000,001 to $2,000,000

$3,886.45 for the first $1,000,000
plus $2.97 for each additional
$1,000 or fraction thereof.

$2,000,001 and up

$6,856.45 for the first $2,0000,000
plus $1.79 for each additional
$1,000 or fraction thereof.

*Fees shall be adjusted annually, based upon the U.S. average Consumer Price

Index for All Urban Consumers.

Add a subsection entitled “Other Inspections and Fees” as follows:

Fences. The building permit fee shall be $20.00.

Storage Tanks. The building permit fee shall be $25.00 each for installation or removal.

Temporary Structure. The building permit fee shall be $25.00. This applies to tents,

canopies, membrane structures and similar structures.”

Other Inspections and fees:

1.Inspections outside of normal business hours $50.00 per hour (1)

(minimum charge—two hours)

Section 109 as amended

2. Reinspection fees assessed under the provisions of | $50.00 per hour (1)




Ordinance 2007-11
Page 4 of 16

3. Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated | $50.00 per hour (1)
4. Additional plan review required by changes, $50.00 per hour (1)
additions or revisions to plans

(minimum charge—one-half hour)
9. For use of outside consultants for plan checking Actual Costs (2)
and inspections, or both

(1) Or the total hourly cost to the jurisdiction, whichever is the greatest. This cost shall
include supervision, overhead, equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the
employees involved.

(2) Actual costs include administrative and overhead costs.

Fee Refunds
The building official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid under this section
which was erroneously paid or collected.
The building official may authorize the refunding of not more than 80 percent of the
permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with

the building code.”

4.0105: Delete IBC Section 108.3 and IRC Section R108.3 and replace with the
following:

"The Building Valuation will be derived from the most current Building Valuation Data
Schedule published in the Building Safety Journal.

A line is added for detached garages valuing them at $15.00 per square foot. A line is
added for open decks valuing them at $10.00 per square foot.

A line is added for underground swimming pools valuing them at $25.00 per square foot
and above ground at $10.00 per square foot.

A line is added for screened porches valuing them at $15.00 per square foot.
Crawl spaces or garage foundations are not included in basement charges.

Foundation permits are to be valued at 20% of full building value, and the rest of the
building will be valued at the remaining 80%.



Ordinance 2007-11
Page 5 of 16

Shell building value will be at warehouse value, and when tenant finishes occur they will
be valued at the difference between warehouse value and the value assigned for the
specific finished use.

Remodels are valued at 1/8 (.125) of full value"

4.0106: Add IBC Sub-section 108.5.1 and amend IRC Section R108.4 by adding
provisions as follows: "Plan Review Fees. When submittal documents are required, a
plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting the submittal documents for plan
review, unless the building official delays requiring payment until permit issuance. Said
plan review fee shall be 65 percent of the building permit fee. This plan review fee is
separate from the permit fee, and is in addition to the permit fee.

When submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan
review or when the project involves deferred submittal items, an additional plan review
fee shall be charged at the applicable rate. This subsection does not apply to Group U
Occupancies or Group R-3 occupancies, unless the building official determines that
there are unusual or unique features requiring specialized plan review.

Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days
following the date of application shall expire by limitation, and plans and other data
submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the
building official. The building official may extend the time for action by the applicant for a
period not exceeding 180 days on request by the applicant showing that circumstances
beyond the control of the applicant have prevented action from being taken. No
application shall be extended more than once. In order to renew action on an
application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan
review fee."

4.0107: In IBC Section 109.3.8 and IRC Section 109.1.5 add the following: "Fences: To
be made after holes have been dug for all corner posts, and for additional posts as
deemed necessary by the Building Inspector; and a final inspection upon completion of
work."

4.0108: In IBC Section 109.3 and IRC Section R109 add the following paragraph:

"Where the work requiring a building permit includes one () or more prefabricated
assemblies, the certificate of approval required by IBC Section 1703.7 may be accepted
in lieu of the written approvals required by IBC subsection 109.3.1 through 109.3.7, and
the frame and lath, and/or wallboard inspection required by IBC Section 109.3.5 where
the use of prefabricated assemblies renders the obtaining of such approvals or
inspection impractical. All certificates of approval for this purpose and as required by
IBC Section 1703.7 of this Code shall be made by the International Code Council,



Ordinance 2007-11
Page 6 of 16

Underwriter's Laboratories, Inc., or any other approved independent inspection agency
qualified to make such certification. Also all prefabricated assemblies must be certified
to comply with regulations of the lowa State Building Code."

4.0109: Add IBC Section 109.7 and IRC Section R109.5 regarding Reinspections as
follows:

“‘Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection
when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or when
corrections called for are not made.

This section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is
rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this code, but as controlling the
practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for such inspection or
reinspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the inspection record card is not posted or
otherwise available on the work site, the approved plans are not readily available to the
inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is requested, or
for deviating from plans requiring the approval of the building official.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall request that it be scheduled in the normal
manner in which inspections are scheduled, and pay the reinspection fee in accordance
with this ordinance.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of
the work will be performed until the required fees have been paid. Only the work

necessary to correct what has been noted in the inspection or reinspection report is to
be done until all reinspection fees are paid and reinspections satisfactorily completed.”

4.0110: In IBC Section 112 and IRC Section R112 add: "The term of office of said
members shall be three (3) years. Any vacancy occurring on the board, caused by
resignation or otherwise, shall be filled by the Mayor, subject to the approval of the
Council, with the terms of such appointments continuing in their established rotation. All
members of such board shall serve without compensation, except their actual
expenses, which shall be subject to the approval of the Council.”

(@)  The Board shall consist of the following persons: Three (3) general or
homebuilding contractors and two (2) members of the general public with a good
understanding of building construction with Architects and Engineers given preference
for this position.”



Ordinance 2007-11
Page 7 of 16

(b)  Hearings. Any person affected by a decision of the Building Official may request
and shall be granted a hearing on the decision, provided that such person shall file in
the office of the Department of Building, a written petition requesting such hearing and
setting forth a brief statement of the grounds therefor, within fifteen (15) days after the
day that the persons received notice of the decision. The petitioner shall pay a fee of
Thirty Dollars ($30.00) on residential and Fifty Dollars ($50.00) on commercial property
appeals at the time of filing the appeal. Upon receipt of such petition and fee, the
Department of Building shall set a time and place for such hearing and shall give
petitioner written notice thereof at least three (3) days before the date set for such
hearing, unless such three (3) day notice requirement is waived, in writing, by the
petitioner. At such hearing the petitioner shall be given an opportunity to be heard to
show why the decision of the Building Official should be modified or withdrawn. The
Building Official shall have the opportunity to be heard to show why his/her decision
should be affirmed. The hearing shall be commenced not later than twenty- five (25)
days after the day on which the petition was filed, unless, for good cause shown, the
Building Official grants a  postponement, in writing, of the hearing.

(c) Decision. After such hearing, the Board shall affirm, modify, or withdraw the
decision of the Building Official. The proceedings at any hearing before the board,
including the findings and decision of the Building Official, if applicable, shall be
summarized, reduced to writing, and entered as a matter of public record in the office of
the Department of Building. Such record shall include a copy of every notice or order
issued in connection with the matter.

(d)  Appeal. Within ten (10) days after the written summary of the proceedings has
been filed in the office of the Department of Building, the City shall file with the Board
either a written acceptance of the decision of the Board, or a notice of its intent to
appeal said decision to any court of competent jurisdiction. Thereafter, the City shall
commence the appropriate action in such court within the ten (10) day period. The
petitioner aggrieved by a decision of the Board may seek relief therefrom in any court of
competent jurisdiction, as provided by laws of the State.

(e) Vacancies. All vacancies occurring on the Board by removal, resignation, or
death, shall be filled by appointment as determined previously. Any member of the
Board may be removed by the City Council for malfeasance in office, incapacity, or
neglect of duty. All appointments made under this Section shall be for the un-expired
term of the position vacated.”

4.0111: In IBC Section 113 and IRC Section R113, add a Subsection as follows:
"Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions of this Code shall be

deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such person shall be deemed guilty of a
separate offense for each and every day or portion hereof during which any violation of



Ordinance 2007-11
Page 8 of 16

any of the provisions of this chapter is committed, continued, or permitted, and upon
conviction of any such violation such person shall be punishabie by a fine of not to
exceed Five Hundred Dollars ($500.00) or as allowed by state code, or by imprisonment
for not more than thirty (30) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment. Citations may
also be issued under Chapter 22 of Title V of the Municipal Code."

4.0112: Add the following sentence to IBC Section 115.4, Method of Service:
“Correction notices posted at the job-site are an acceptable form of notice"

4.0301: In IRC Table R301.2(1), fill in the table blanks regarding climatic and
geographic design criteria as follows:

“Ground Snow Load: 30 p.s.f.

Wind Speed: 90 m.p.h.

Seismic Design Category: 0

Weathering: Severe

Frost line depth: 42" below grade

Termite: Moderate to Heavy

Decay: Slight to Moderate

Winter design Temp: -5 degrees F.

Ice Shield Underlayment Rqd: YES*

Flood Hazards: Adopted May 29, 1979, and the current
FIRM is dated July 19, 2000.

Air Freezing Index: 1,833

Mean Annual Temp: 48.6 degrees F.

*See amendment to IBC 1507.2.8.2 and IRC R905.2.7.1 regarding ice shield
alternative.”

4.0302: Amend IRC Section R311.5.3 by adding the following exception: “Because of
the variation in floor coverings, the dimension of the top and bottom riser of an interior
stair may vary up to one (1) inch or less from the stairway riser dimension, however in
no case shall the riser height exceed seven and three-quarters (7-3/4”) inches.”

4.0303: Amend IRC Section R311.5.6.2 by adding the following sentence: “Handrails

shall be permitted to be interrupted by a newel post at a turn, and by a wall, ceiling, or
similar feature, if the handrail is offset and continued immediately for the full length of
the stairs.”

4.0304: Delete IRC Section R317.1.

4.0305: Amend IRC Section R317.2 by including “And Two-family dwellings” in the title
after the word ‘Townhouses’.



Ordinance 2007-11
Page 9 of 16

4.0401: Amend IRC Section R403 and R404 by adding the following:

“On residential occupancies, seasonal rooms may be constructed on a foundation
consisting of a minimum 6” by 6” treated wood columns located under all load bearing
points, and the columns are to be supported with minimum 24” by 24” by 10” thick
footings at least 42" below grade; or the foundation may be structurally designed.

4.0901: In IBC Section 907.2.9 add the following: "Smoke detectors in common areas:
all R-2 occupancies not otherwise required to be equipped with an automatic fire alarm
system shall be equipped with smoke detectors in the common exitways. They shall be
installed on each floor level and nominally spaced thirty (30) feet apart beginning no
more than fifteen (15) feet inside the common exits."

4.1001: Add IBC Subsection 1026.1.1 and IRC Section R310.1.5 as follows: "In
basements, maximum sill height may be measured from an elevated landing not less
than 36" wide by not less than 20" out from the exterior wall. The landing shall be
securely affixed to the floor below and the wall under the window it serves.

The following shall be permitted as alternatives to the required escape or rescue
window in a basement:

A. An automatic fire sprinkler system designed to protect the entire structure in
accordance with NFPA-13D as published by the National Fire Protection Association,
Batterymarch Park, Quincy, Ma. 02169.

B. A second stairway which enters the first story in an area separated from the other
stairway by a minimum of a solid wall which has hinged doors mounted in any openings.
Both areas on the first story which contain the stairways shall have a door opening
directly into a street, alley, yard or exit court."

Also in IBC Section 1026 and IRC Section R310 add:

Walkout basements or basements with an emergency escape window shall not be
required to add an additional emergency escape window in sleeping rooms, provided
the emergency escape window or door and the stair to the floor above are placed a
distance apart equal to not less than one half of the length of the maximum overali
diagonal dimension of the basement area, and provided additional smoke detectors are
installed in each area or room in the basement (determination to be made by the
Building Official)."

4.1201: Amend IBC Subsection 1209.2 by adding the following:






